496 Acts 2016

THE ROAD TRAFFIC (AMENDMENT NO. 2) ACT 2016
Act No. 23 of 2016

1 assent

PARAMASIVUM PILLAY VYAPOORY
25 November 2016 Acting President of the Republic

ARRANGEMENT OF SECTIONS

Section
1. Short title
2. Interpretation
3. New section 51A inserted in principal Act
4. Section 123B of principal Act amended
5. Section 123D of principal Act amended
6. Section 123G of principal Act amended
7. Section 123L of principal Act amended
8. New section 123LA inserted in principal Act
9. Section 140 of principal Act amended
10. Various sections of principal Act amended
11.  Second Schedule to principal Act amended
12. Consequential amendment
13.  Commencement
FIRST SCHEDULE

SECOND SCHEDULE
THIRD SCHEDULE




Acts 2016 497

An Act

To amend the Road Traffic Act

ENACTED by the Parliament of Mauritius, as follows —

1. Short title
This Act may be cited as the Road Traffic (Amendment No. 2)
Act 2016.
2. Interpretation
In this Act —
“principal Act” means the Road Traffic Act.

3. New section 51A inserted in principal Act

The principal Act is amended by inserting, after section 51, the
following new section —

51A. Credit for disqualification
A Court before which a person is convicted of an offence

under this Act shall —

(a) in determining the period for which the person is to
be disqualified from driving a motor vehicle, give
credit to the person for the period during which he was
disqualified from driving a motor vehicle pursuant to
section 123LA(4)(a); and

(b) indicate in its judgment that such credit has been given
to the person.

4. Section 123B of principal Act amended
Section 123B of the principal Act is amended —

(a) in subsection (1), by deleting the words “3 years” and
replacing them by the words “5 years”;



498

Acto8016

(b)

by inserting, after subsection (1), the following new subsection —

(1A) Inthe case of a second or subsequent conviction,
the offender under subsection (1) shall be liable to a fine of
not less than 75,000 rupees nor more than 100,000 rupees and
to imprisonment for a term of not less than 12 months nor
more than 8 years.

Section 123D of principal Act amended

Section 123D of the principal Act is amended —

(@)

(b)

in subsection (1), by deleting the words “3 years” and
replacing them by the words “5 years”;

by inserting, after subsection (1), the following new subsection —

(1A) Inthe case of a second or subsequent conviction,
the offender under subsection (1) shall be liable to a fine of
not less than 75,000 rupees nor more than 100,000 rupees and
to imprisonment for a term of not less than 12 months nor
more than 8 years.

Section 123G of principal Act amended

Section 123G of the principal Act is amended —

(@)

by repealing subsection (1) and replacing it by the following
subsection —

(1)  Where a person is —

(a) ridingacycle on aroad or any other public
place;

(b)  driving a motor vehicle on a road or any
other public place;

(c) subject to section 123E(3), in charge of
a motor vehicle on a road or any other
public place;

(d)  occupying the driving seat of a motor
vehicle on a road or any other public place
and attempting to put the motor vehicle in
motion;



Acts 2016 499

()  occupying the front seat in a motor vehicle
as a competent driver supervising a learner
driver who is driving the motor vehicle on
a road or any other public place; or

(f)  onaroad orany other public place, driving
or attempting to drive a motor vehicle
which is involved in a road accident,

a police officer in uniform may, where he has
reasonable suspicion to believe that the person is under
the influence of alcohol, require, subject to section
123K, that person to provide a specimen of his breath
for a breath test, either at or near the place where the
requirement is made or at the nearest police station
where the test may be carried out.

(b)  in subsection (2) —

(1)

(i)

by repealing paragraph (a) and replacing it by the
following paragraph —

(@) (i) A person who, without
reasonable excuse, fails to provide a specimen of
his breath for a breath test following a requirement
under subsection (1)(a), shall commit an offence and
shall, on conviction, be liable to a fine of not less than
5,000 rupees nor more than 25,000 rupees.

(i) A person who, without
reasonable excuse, fails to provide a specimen of his
breath for a breath test following a requirement under
subsection (1)(b) to (f), shall commit an offence and
shall, on conviction, be liable to a fine of not less than
20,000 rupees nor more than 25,000 rupees.

in paragraph (b), by deleting the figure “5,000” and
replacing it by the figure “25,000”.



500

Acts 2016

7. Section 123L of principal Act amended

Section 123L of the principal Act is amended —

(a)

(b)

by repealing subsection (1) and replacing it by the following
subsection —

(1) A person required to provide a specimen of
breath shall, upon the breath test showing alcohol in excess
of the prescribed limit, or upon a refusal to submit to such
a test, be detained at a police station until it appears to the
police officer that, were that person then driving or attempting
to drive a motor vehicle on a road or other public place,
he would not be committing an offence under section 123D,
123E or 123F.

by repealing subsection (2).

8. New section 123LA inserted in principal Act

The principal Act is amended by inserting, after section 123L, the
following new section —

123LA. Order made against persons under the influence of
intoxicating drinks or drugs

(1)  Where a person —

(a) 1is reasonably suspected by the Police of having
committed an offence under section 123D, 123E
or 123F; or

(b) fails, without reasonable excuse, to provide
a specimen of his breath for a breath test or
specimens of breath for analysis, or a specimen
of blood or urine, or both, for a laboratory test
when required to do so pursuant to section 123G
or 123H,

a police officer shall, at the earliest opportunity, make an application
to a Magistrate, in such form as may be prescribed, for an order
under subsection (4).



Acts 2016 501

(2) The Magistrate shall, on an application made under
subsection (1), issue a summons to that person to attend Court and
show cause why an order under subsection (4) shall not be made.

(3) The Magistrate shall —

(a)

(b)

where a test carried out pursuant to section 123G
or 123H on a person referred to in subsection (1)(a)
shows that —

(1)  the proportion of alcohol in 100 millilitres
of his breath is 46 microgrammes or more;

(i)  the proportion of alcohol in 100 millilitres of
his blood is 100 milligrammes or more; or

(ii1)  the proportion of alcohol in 100 millilitres of
his urine is 134 milligrammes or more; or

in the case of a person referred to in subsection (1)(b),

after hearing the person, make, unless he thinks fit to do otherwise,
an order referred to in subsection (4).

(4)  Where the person referred to in subsection (1) —

(a)

(b)

holds a driving licence, a provisional driving
licence or an international driving permit,
the Magistrate shall, unless he thinks fit to do
otherwise, order that the person be disqualified
from driving a motor vehicle for a period not
exceeding 2 months from the date of the order;

does not hold a driving licence, a provisional
driving licence or an international driving permit,
the Magistrate shall, unless he thinks fit to do
otherwise, order that the person be disqualified
from holding or obtaining a licence in Mauritius
for a period not exceeding 6 months from the
date of the order.



502

Acts 2016

(5) (a) Where a person is disqualified from driving a
motor vehicle under subsection (4)(a), the Magistrate shall order
that person to surrender his driving licence, provisional driving
licence or international driving permit, as the case may be, to the
Court within 5 days of the date of the order.

(b)  Any person who fails to surrender his licence or
permit within the period specified in paragraph (a) shall commit an
offence and shall, on conviction, be liable to a fine not exceeding
10,000 rupees and to imprisonment for a term not exceeding
12 months.

(6)  The Magistrate may hear and determine an application
made under subsection (1) as though it were a civil matter.

(7)  An appeal from the order of the Magistrate made under
subsection (4) shall not operate as a stay of execution of that order.

Section 140 of principal Act amended
Section 140 of the principal Act is amended, in subsection (1)(d),

by deleting the words “4 hours” and replacing them by the words
“one hour”.

10.

Various sections of principal Act amended

The principal Act is amended, in the sections specified in the first

column of the First Schedule, by deleting the words specified in the second
column of that Schedule and replacing them by the corresponding words
specified in the third column of that Schedule.

11.

Second Schedule to principal Act amended

The Second Schedule to the principal Act is amended —

(a) by deleting the items pertaining to sections 123A, 123B,
123C, 123D, 123E and 123F and their corresponding entries
and replacing them by the items pertaining to those sections
and their corresponding entries, respectively, as set out in the
Second Schedule to this Act;



Acts 2016 503

(b) by inserting, after the item pertaining to section 123F, the new
items and their corresponding entries as set out in the Third
Schedule to this Act.

12. Consequential amendment

The Road Traffic (Prescribed Devices) Regulations 2010 are
amended, in regulation 4, by revoking paragraph (a) and replacing it by
the following paragraph —

(a) sections 123D, 123E, 123F, 123G, 123H, 123L, 123LA,
123AD, 124 and 166 of the Act;

13. Commencement
(1)  Subject to subsection (2), this Act shall come into operation

on a date to be fixed by Proclamation.

(2) Different dates may be fixed for the coming into operation of
different sections of this Act.

Passed by the National Assembly on the twenty second day of
November two thousand and sixteen.

Bibi Safeena Lotun (Mrs)
Clerk of the National Assembly




Acts 2016

504

SIBOA § SUIPIOIXI JOU pue SYHUOW 7|
uey) SS9 10U JO W9 B J0J Juswuosuidulr yim 19y3030)

soadnu 00°s, ueyy a1ow Jou s93dn1 ())(‘QS UeY3 SS] J0U

sIeok ¢ SUIpa2IXd Jou W9 B 10J Judwuostidwr o) pue

soadn )00‘0S uey) 210w Jou saadni (OO‘QZ ULy} SS9 Jou

soadn )00‘0z uey) 210w Jou saadni (OO0 ULy} SSOf Jou

syIuowW 9 SUIPAIOXI Jou WIS} B 10§ JuowuosLidwr 0) pue

soodnu 00‘s 1 ueys a1ow Jou sa3dn ()OS uBY} SSI[ J0U

soadnu 000§ ueyl a1o0w Jou s23dnI (‘ST UL} SS] J0U

soadnu 000z ueyl 210w Jou s23dn1 (OO ULy} SS[ J0U

HIOVIdId OL SAIOM

SYIUOW 7| UBY) QIOW JOU SYJUOW 9 UBY) SSI]
j0u JO L9} © 103 JuowuosLidwr yim 10730303 soadnr

000°0S uey) 210w Jou sdadnr (0‘pg uey SS9 Jou

sypuow 9 SUTPa’IX
jou wid} e Joj judwuosudwr 03 pue soadnr

000°SZ uey) 210w Jou sdadnr (OO‘Q] UBY} SSI[ J0U

soodnr

00007 ueyy a1ow Jou seadnr (OQ°S uey) ssof jou

syjuow ¢ SuIpavIXd
jou wRy e I0j juowuosudwr o) pue soadnr

000°01 uey) a1ow Jou saadnr ()OQ‘E uUeY} SSI[ JoU

soadna

000°0Z uey) 210w Jou sdadnr (0O‘Q uey SS9 Jou

soadnr

000°01 uey) 21ow Jou saadnr ())Q‘G UeY} SSI[ JoU

JILATIA 34 OL SAIOoM

[0T uonoas]

HTINAAHDIS LSHIA

(@(y4!

(Dagzt

(9174

(Dogzn

@(Dveen

®(1Dvezr

NOILLDYS



505

Acts 2016

SIBoA ¢

SIBOA § SUIPIOIXI JOU pue SYHUOW 7|
uey) SSI[ JOU JO W} B J0J Judwuosuduwr ym 19y3230)

saadnr )00°s, uey) d10w Jou s3adn1 ()OO‘QS ULy} SSO[ Jou

s1eak ¢ SUIpadIXd Jou WLId) € 10j Judwuostduwr o) pue

soadn )00‘0S uey) d10w Jou saadni (OO‘Qg ULy} SS9 Jou

HIOVIdIT OL SAIOM

syuouwr 9

SYIUOW 7| UBY) 2IOW JOU SYIUOW 9 UBY) SSI]
JOU JO W) B J0J JudwuosLidwr yiim Joy3030) soadns

000°0S uey) 210w Jou sdadnr (0‘pg ueyr ss9| jJou

sypuow 9 SUIPa’IX
jou wid) e Joj judwuosudwr 03 pue soadnr

000°SZ uey) 210w Jou sdadnr (OO‘Q] UBY} SSI[ J0U

JILATIA 34 OL SAIOoM

ponunuoy - I'INAAHOS LSAIA

(9)or1

(P)acet

(©)a¢cz1

NOILLDYS



Acts 2016

506

juanbasqns
0
squowr 9 | ON | S9A N SOA | ON| Sox 10 pary ],
Jo pouad uoneoyrjenbsip winwiuljl | ON | SOA | ON| SOA | S9A | ON pu0o9g
SurALp
pay1renbsip S1IOPUSYJO JT. | ON | xS9A | SOA| ON| ON/| ON 1SIL] | 9)BIOPISUOOUI 0 SSO[AIRD) | DETI
SIBOA ¢ juonbosqns
Jo pouad uoneoyrjenbsip winwiuIjA | ON | SOA | ON| SOA | ON| SOA | 1o puoodg
SIBdA 7 SurAnp snosaguep
Jo pouad uoneoyrjenbsip winwiruij | ON | S9A | ON| SOA | ON| SoA 1811 Aq yreap uisne) | ezl
sypuowr 7| wanbasqns
Jo pouod uoneoyrjenbsip winwiuIjy | ON | SOA | ON| SOA | ON| SOA | Jo puoods
syuowr 9
Jo pouad uoneoyrjenbsip wnwiIuIA
payirenbsIp ST IOPUIJO J1u | SOA | +S9A | SOA | ON | SOA | ON 18I SurALIp sno1ddue( | VETI

HTINAAHIS ANODHS

[11 uonoag]




507

Acts 2016

sywn] paquiosaxd

syuowt ¢ anbasqns
9A0QE UOIIRIUIIU0D
Jo pouad uoneoyrjenbsip wnwiuIA | ON | SOA| ON| SOA | ON| SOA | 10 puoods
[OY0J]. 1M J[OIYA
sypuour 7 | J10j0W JO 931eYD Ul
Jo pourad uorreoyrenbsip wnwiurjy | ON | SOA | ON| SOA | SOA | ON 3sIq Suroq 1o Sulaug | €71
Snap
syuowt ¢ anbasqns
10 YuLIp Surjesrxojut Jo
Jo pouad uoneoyrjenbsip wnwiuIy [ ON | SOA| ON| SOA | ON| SOA | 10 puoods
20UdNYuI IOpUN USYM
sypuour 7 | 9[OIYA 10JOW JO AFIRYD
Jo pourad uorreoyrenbsip wnwiurjy | ON | SOA | ON| SOA | SOA | ON 3sIq ur 3urdq 10 Julaug | HETT
Snap
SIBdA G juanbasqns
10 YuLIp Junesrxojur
Jo pouad uoneoyrjenbsip winwiurjAl | ON | SOA | ON| SOA | ON| SOA | 1o puoodg
JO douanyur ayy Jopun
s1eak ¢ uoyM SUIALIP SSI[oIED
Jo pouad uoneoyrjenbsip winwiurjN | ON | SOA | ON| SOA | ON| SoA IS Aq yreap Suisne) | €zl

panunuoy - I'INAIHIS ANOIIS




Acts 2016

508

syuowr §
Jo porrad uoneoyijenbsip wnwiury

syluowr §

Jo porrad uoneoyijenbsip wnwiur

ON

ON

ON

ON

SOk  ON SOA  ON  S9x

SOA  ON S9K SOA  ON

SO ON SO ON  Sox
SOk ON SOA S9K  ON

[11 uonoag]
ATNATHDS ATHL

juonbosqns

10 puodag§

181

juanbasqns

10 pu0dds

1T

sisATeue
J10J QuLIN 1O POO[q
‘yreaiq Jo suowroads

opiaoad o3 Surpre

159) yreaIq
10 3ealq Jo udwoads

opraoid o3 Surjre

HETI

DETI

103/11/16 — 1247

By AUTHORITY: GOVERNMENT PRINTING DEPARTMENT, LA Tour KOENIG



